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MERSEYSIDE RECYCLING & WASTE AUTHORITY

MERSEYSIDE... A PLACE
WHERE NOTHING IS WASTED




Freedom of Information / Environmental Information Requests

Disclosure Log 2011
	No
	Date
	Type and Details of request
	Source of request
	Result of request
	Response Date 
	Within 20 working day limit

	1
	1.02.11
	Freedom of Information request for list of contractors and sub-contractors of the Gillmoss MRF, Liverpool
	Publication
	Information released in full 
	Acknowledgement 7.02.11 

Initial response 17.02.11

Final response 2.03.11
	Yes

	2
	7.02.11
	Freedom of Information request for municipal waste management figures
	Member of the public 
	Information release in full
	Acknowledgement 7.02.11

Final response 17.02.11
	Yes

	3
	28.02.11
	Freedom of Information request – Merseyside and Halton Waste Partnership – waste analysis works undertaken in 2010
	Member of the public 
	Information released in full
	Final response 1.04.11
	Yes

	4
	20.04.11
	Freedom of Information request for various financial details regarding the range of consultants fees in 2010/2011 financial year
	Publication
	Information release with personal information removed


	Acknowledged 20.04.11

Final response 24.05.11
	Yes

	5
	26.04.11
	Freedom of Information request – information regarding Halton Council elected members presence at MWDA Authority meetings and expenses
	Publication
	Information released in full
	Acknowledged

28.04.11

Final response 10.05.11


	Yes

	6
	16.06.11
	Freedom of Information request (via WhatDoTheyKnow.com) requesting information relating to the use of the internet sub net
	Member of the public
	Information released in full
	Final response 27.06.11
	Yes

	7
	23.06.11
	Freedom of Information request about the number of domestic dwellings owned or transferred by the Authority.
	Broadcast media
	Information not held
	Final response 

27.06.11
	Yes

	8
	27.06.11
	Freedom of Information request about excess waste bins 
	Member of the public 
	Information supplied via phone call (operational enquiry)
	Responded by telephone 27.06.11
	Yes

	9
	25.07.11
	Freedom of Information request (via Sefton Council) regarding the collection, transport and disposal of clinical waste
	Member of the public 
	Information supplied in full
	Acknowledgement 25.07.11

Final response 3.08.11
	Yes

	10
	10.08.11
	Freedom of Information request regarding a site within the Waste Development Planning Document
	Member of the public 
	Refused  - do not hold the information
	Response 10.08.11
	Yes

	11
	10.10.11
	Freedom of Information request regarding general and organic household waste, dry kerbside recycling and recycling centres 
	Research company
	Information released in full
	Acknowledgement
11.10.11

Final response

1.11.11
	Yes

	12
	24.11.11
	Freedom of Information request requesting licence for incinerator at Broadgreen Hospital
	Member of the public 
	Refused - Information not held
	Response 8.12.11
	Yes


